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ABSTRACT 

This report is a synopsis of the whole Projek Sarjana Muda II for the fourth year 
Bachelor of Computer Science students. The main objective of this subject is to 
preparation of Projek Sarjana Muda IT for the last semester. The project title is Sub­
Contractor Performance Quality Evaluation System (PQeVS). This system is based from 
the real industry that gains the requirement from Selia Selenggara Selatan Sdn. Bhd. The 
current system is using conventional system. The new system is develop to solve all 
problems from current system such as redundant data, difficulty to search and update the 
evaluation information, analyze the information and difficulties to makes a decision 
from the performance evaluation. This system is to make an evaluation to the 300 sub­
contractors that registered with the SSSSB. There is 4 item that must be evaluate consist 
of quality of works, report, safety and financial. Quality of works item includes 3 scopes 
that are specification, timely completion and manpower, machine, plant and tool. Report 
item includes 3 scopes which are claim, site report and photo. Safety item just include 
one scope that is safety requirement. Lastly, fmancial item just include one scope that is 
financial capability that base on material and team supplied, time delivery, quality and 
other relevant matter to precede works. It will enable the organization effectively to plan 
and select the required sub-contractor for their project and view the performance quality 
of each sub-contractors work. This system is more focus in routine maintenance works 
that include the certain item that to be evaluated. This system will calculate all marks or 
rating automatically and from the total score, district and type of work all users can view 
an analysis of the performance evaluation by report and graph. 






































